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PATENT LAW 
 
Contentious nature opposition proceedings 
• the post-grant opposition proceedings under the 
EPC are in principle to be considered as contentious 
proceedings between parties normally representing 
opposite interests, who should be given equally fair 
treatment.  
In these circumstances, it may be questioned whether 
the statement made by the Enlarged Board of Appeal 
in case G 1/84 (OJ EPO 1985, 299, point 4 of the rea-
sons) that "it would be wrong to regard such 
(opposition) proceedings (under the EPC) as essen-
tially contentious proceedings between warring parties, 
where the deciding body takes a neutral position, as 
would be the case in revocation proceedings before a 
national Court" is quite accurate, at least as a generali-
sation. This statement, sometimes referred to in the 
discussion on the issues at stake in the present cases in 
support of a wide investigative approach to be taken by 
the EPO, has to be seen in the special context of case G 
1/84. In any case, it seems to the Enlarged Board in its 
present composition that post-grant opposition proceed-
ings under the EPC are in principle to be considered as 
contentious proceedings between parties normally rep-
resenting opposite interests, who should be given 
equally fair treatment.  
 
Double function Statement in Notice of Opposition 
• having the double function of governing (to-
gether with other provisions) the admissibility of the 
opposition and of establishing at the same time the 
legal and factual framework, within which the sub-
stantive examination of the opposition in principle 
shall be conducted. 
6. According to Article 101(2) EPC, the examination of 
the opposition shall be conducted in accordance with 
the provisions of the Implementing Regulations (i.e. the 
Rules). Read in conjunction only with Rule 56(1) EPC, 
Rule 55(c) EPC may give the impression that the con-
tent of the statement of Rule 55(c) EPC only implies a 
formal requirement for admissibility of the opposition 
without any further legal effect on the examination of 
the opposition. This would seem to be the position of 
the opponent (appellant) in case G 9/91. In the 
Enlarged Board's opinion, this is a too narrow view on 
the function of Rule 55(c) EPC. This provision must be 
considered in the context of the EPC as a whole, having 
regard to the particular character of its post-grant oppo-
sition system as outlined above. Being so considered, 
Rule 55(c) EPC only makes sense interpreted as having 

the double function of governing (together with other 
provisions) the admissibility of the opposition and of 
establishing at the same time the legal and factual 
framework, within which the substantive examination 
of the opposition in principle shall be conducted. The 
latter function is of particular importance in that it 
gives the patentee a fair chance to consider his position 
at an early stage of the proceedings. 
 
Scope of opposition 
•  in its examination of an opposition or an appeal 
an Opposition Division or a Board of Appeal is 
bound by the statement of the opponent under Rule 
55(c) EPC of the extent to which the patent is op-
posed and of the grounds for opposition 
The requirement of Rule 55(c) EPC to specify the ex-
tent to which the patent is opposed within the time limit 
prescribed by Article 99(1) EPC would obviously be 
pointless if later on other parts of the patent than those 
so opposed could freely be drawn into the proceedings. 
This would also be contrary to the basic concept of 
post-grant opposition under the EPC as outlined above. 
By limiting the extent to which the patent is opposed to 
only certain subject-matters, the opponent deliberately 
refrains from making use of his right under the EPC to 
oppose remaining subject-matters covered by the pat-
ent. Such subject-matters are therefore, strictly 
speaking, not subject to any "opposition" in the sense 
of Articles 101 and 102 EPC, nor are there any "pro-
ceedings" in the sense of Articles 114 and 115 EPC in 
existence concerning such non-opposed subject-
matters. Consequently, the EPO has no competence to 
deal with them at all.  It follows that the answer to the 
first question put to the Enlarged Board in case G 9/91 
has to be affirmative.  
• dependent subject-matters have to be considered 
as being implicitly covered by the statement under 
Rule 55(c) EPC 
However, even if the opposition is explicitly directed 
only to the subject-matter of an independent claim of a 
European patent, subject-matters covered by claims 
which depend on such an independent claim may also 
be examined as to patentability, if the independent 
claim falls in opposition or appeal proceedings, pro-
vided their validity is prima facie in doubt on the basis 
of already available information (cf. T 293/88, OJ EPO 
1992, 220). Such dependent subject-matters have to be 
considered as being implicitly covered by the statement 
under Rule 55(c) EPC (cf. paragraph 8 above). 
 
Opposition Division may raise grounds for opposi-
tion on its own motion 
• where, prima facie, there are clear reasons to be-
lieve that such grounds are relevant and would in 
whole or in part prejudice the maintenance of the 
European patent 
Thus, an Opposition Division may, in application of 
Article 114(1) EPC, of its own motion raise a ground 
for opposition not covered by the statement pursuant to 
Rule 55(c) EPC or consider such a ground raised by the 
opponent (or referred to by a third party under Article 
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115 EPC) after the expiry of the time limit laid down in 
Article 99(1) EPC. At the same time, the Enlarged 
Board would like to emphasise that the consideration of 
grounds not properly covered by the statement pursuant 
to Rule 55(c) EPC, as an exception to the principle es-
tablished by the Board in paragraph 6 above, should 
only take place before the Opposition Division in cases 
where, prima facie, there are clear reasons to believe 
that such grounds are relevant and would in whole or in 
part prejudice the maintenance of the European patent. 
The possibility of disregarding facts and evidence in 
support of fresh grounds not submitted in due time un-
der Article 114(2) EPC should of course also be kept in 
mind. 
 
Source: epo.org 
 
 
Enlarged Board of Appeal EPO, 31 March 1993  
(P. Gori E. Persson J. Brinkhof K. Bruchhausen R. 
Schulte G. Szabo P. van den Berg) 
Decision of the Enlarged Board of Appeal  
dated 31 March 1993 
G 9/91 
[…] 
Summary of Facts and Submissions        
I. European patent No. 76 691, concerning certain an-
hydride polymers and imide polymers and processes 
for preparing them, was granted to Rohm and Haas 
Company in 1986. Within the period of nine months 
laid down in Article 99(1) EPC, notice of opposition to 
the patent was filed by BASF AG. In the statement pur-
suant to Rule 55(c) EPC the opponent requested that 
the patent be revoked to the extent it concerned poly-
mers containing anhydride units on the ground that this 
subject-matter was not patentable within the terms of 
Articles 52 - 57 EPC (i.e. the ground referred to in Ar-
ticle 100(a) EPC). The subject-matter relating to 
polymers containing imide units was not attacked by 
the opponent in the course of the opposition proceed-
ings. By an interlocutory decision of 28 August 1989, 
the Opposition Division maintained the patent in 
amended form on the basis of a set of 11 claims, of 
which Claims 1-8 were directed to a polymer with im-
ide groups and the preparation thereof and Claims 9-11 
were related to a polymer with anhydride units and the 
preparation thereof.  
II. The opponent appealed against the decision of the 
Opposition Division; the appeal (T 580/89) was allo-
cated to the Board of Appeal 3.3.3. The opponent 
requested that the appealed decision be set aside and 
the (entire) patent be revoked, arguing, for the first 
time, that not only the subject-matters relating to anhy-
dride polymers but also those relating to imide 
polymers (including the respective preparation thereof) 
were not patentable.  
III. Furthermore, in the course of the appeal proceed-
ings a third party presented observations under Article 
115 EPC, submitting that the subject-matters relating to 
both of the above types of polymers were not pat-
entable due to lack of novelty and inventive step (in 

fact, such observations had been filed even during the 
proceedings before the Opposition Division but had not 
reached the file until after the decision of the Opposi-
tion Division was given and were therefore not 
considered by the Opposition Division).  
IV. The patentee then offered to dispose of the appeal 
by deleting Claims 9-11 relating to anhydride polymers 
arguing that the Board should not express any opinion 
as to the alleged invalidity of unopposed Claims 1-8 
relating to imide polymers (cf. paragraph I above); to 
do so would entail an examination contrary to Article 
114(1) EPC as interpreted by the Board of Appeal 3.3.1 
in case T 9/87 (OJ EPO 1989, 438).  
V. In response to this, the above third party submitted 
further observations, wherein the obligation of the EPO 
vis-à-vis the public to examine the facts of its own mo-
tion pursuant to Article 114(1) EPC was emphasised; 
reference was in this context made in particular to the 
decision of the Board of Appeal 3.4.1 in case T 156/84 
(OJ EPO 1988, 372). The patentee, in maintaining his 
position, submitted that Article 99(1) EPC carries a 
mandatory time limit which would be rendered mean-
ingless if Article 114 EPC were applicable in the 
present circumstances as suggested by the opponent.  
VI. Board of Appeal 3.3.3, considering that the above 
issue concerned an important point of law within the 
meaning of Article 112(1)(a) EPC, decided on 29 Au-
gust 1991 to refer the following questions to the 
Enlarged Board of Appeal (reference number G 9/91):  
1. Is the power of an Opposition Division or, by reason 
of Rule 66(1) EPC, of a Board of Appeal to examine 
and decide on the maintenance of a European patent 
under Articles 101 and 102 EPC dependent upon the 
extent to which the patent is opposed in the notice of 
opposition pursuant to Rule 55(c) EPC?  
2. If the answer to the first question should be affirma-
tive, are there any exceptions to such dependence?  
VII. On 4 October 1991, the President of the EPO, 
making use of his power under Article 112(1)(b) EPC, 
referred the following question to the Enlarged Board 
of Appeal (reference number G 10/91): Is the Opposi-
tion Division in the examination of the opposition 
obliged to consider all the grounds for opposition re-
ferred to in Article 100 EPC or is this examination 
restricted to the grounds referred to by the opponent in 
his statement of grounds of opposition?  
VIII. In the reasons for his referral, the President re-
ferred in particular to conflicting decisions on the 
above point of law given by Board of Appeal 3.3.1 in 
cases T 320/88 (unpublished) and T 182/89 (OJ EPO 
1991, 391) on the one hand, and Board of Appeal 3.4.1 
in case T 493/88 (OJ EPO 1991, 380) on the other. In 
the President's view, this divergency had created a con-
siderable legal uncertainty as to how to carry out the 
opposition procedure under the EPC. He further sub-
mitted that neither a general obligation to consider all 
grounds for opposition referred to in Article 100 EPC, 
nor a general restriction to consider only such grounds 
relied upon by the opponent would provide an appro-
priate solution. One should rather try to find a way of 
combining the purpose of the opposition procedure, 
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which is to enable the EPO to decide on the validity of 
European patents on a broader basis than during the 
procedure up to grant, with a practicable possibility for 
the Opposition Division to achieve this purpose.  
IX. In his referral, the President also drew attention to 
the close relationship between the point of law, which 
he was referring to the Enlarged Board of Appeal and 
the one which is the subject of case G 9/91 (cf. para-
graph VI above), by pointing out that the total basis for 
the opposition according to Rule 55(c) EPC is deter-
mined by the extent to which the European patent is 
opposed as well as by the grounds on which the opposi-
tion is based.  
X. On 15 April 1992, the Enlarged Board, considering 
that the points of law which had been referred to the 
Board in case G 9/91 and case G 10/91 concerned simi-
lar subject-matters, decided to consider these points of 
law in consolidated proceedings in accordance with Ar-
ticle 8 of the Rules of Procedure of the Enlarged Board 
of Appeal.  
XI. In a communication dated 27 April 1992, the par-
ties to the proceedings in case G 9/91 (T 580/89) were 
informed about the referral of the President of the EPO 
in case G 10/91 and invited to file any observations 
they might wish to make on the matters before the 
Enlarged Board. The opponent (appellant) in case G 
9/91 filed such observations by letter dated 25 August 
1992, while the patentee (respondent) declared that he 
did not intend to file any observations.  
XII. On 30 November 1992, oral proceedings took 
place before the Enlarged Board in the presence of rep-
resentatives of the opponent (appellant) in case G 9/91 
and a representative of the President of the EPO in case 
G 10/91; the patentee (respondent) in case G 9/91 had 
informed the Board that he did not wish to attend the 
hearing.  
Reasons for the Decision        
1. The questions referred to the Enlarged Board in the 
present cases concern some fundamental aspects of op-
position and appeals procedure under the EPC.  
2. As to the general scope of opposition under the EPC, 
it is of importance that it takes place only after grant of 
the European patent, i.e. at a point in time when its 
proprietor is enjoying in each designated Contracting 
State the same rights as would be conferred by a na-
tional patent granted in that State (Articles 64 and 99 
EPC). Thus, the relief sought by the opponent is not, as 
in traditional pre-grant opposition, refusal of the patent 
application but revocation of the patent as granted (in 
its entirety or in part) with effect ex tunc in all desig-
nated Contracting States (Article 68 EPC). 
Furthermore, the grounds for opposition (Article 100 
EPC) being limited to and essentially the same as the 
grounds for revocation under national law (Article 138 
EPC), it appears that the concept of post-grant opposi-
tion under the EPC differs considerably from that of 
classical pre-grant opposition and in fact has several 
important features more in common with the concept of 
traditional revocation procedure (cf. Haertel in GRUR 
INT, April 1970, p. 99: "Das nachträgliche Einspruchs-
verfahren kommt in seiner Wirkung einem 

europäischen Nichtigkeitsverfahren nahe"). This char-
acteristic was further emphasised by the addition at a 
late stage in the preparation of the EPC of the possibil-
ity of opposing a European patent even if it has been 
surrendered or has lapsed for all Contracting States 
(Article 99(3) EPC; cf. the report by Braendli in the 
minutes of the Munich Diplomatic Conference pub-
lished by the Government of the Federal Republic of 
Germany, p. 186: "... this amendment has raised the 
opposition proceedings another step towards the level 
of actual revocation proceedings"). In these circum-
stances, it may be questioned whether the statement 
made by the Enlarged Board of Appeal in case G 
1/84 (OJ EPO 1985, 299, point 4 of the reasons) that 
"it would be wrong to regard such (opposition) pro-
ceedings (under the EPC) as essentially contentious 
proceedings between warring parties, where the decid-
ing body takes a neutral position, as would be the case 
in revocation proceedings before a national Court" is 
quite accurate, at least as a generalisation. This state-
ment, sometimes referred to in the discussion on the 
issues at stake in the present cases in support of a wide 
investigative approach to be taken by the EPO, has to 
be seen in the special context of case G 1/84. In any 
case, it seems to the Enlarged Board in its present com-
position that post-grant opposition proceedings under 
the EPC are in principle to be considered as contentious 
proceedings between parties normally representing op-
posite interests, who should be given equally fair 
treatment.  
3. It is inherent in any post-grant opposition procedure 
that the patent office cannot take any action in respect 
of a granted patent, however clear it may have become 
after grant that the patent is invalid, unless initiated by 
an admissible opposition. If no opposition is filed, the 
patent can only be attacked in revocation proceedings 
before a national court. In other words: the competence 
of the patent office to deal with the patent depends on 
the action taken by the opponent.  
4. A post-grant opposition system may be constructed 
in different ways. It would, for example, be possible to 
allow the opponent to confine his action to making a 
simple request for a general re-examination of the pat-
ent application as filed on the basis of some general 
observations. The post-grant opposition procedure un-
der the EPC, however, is not constructed in this way. 
As appears from Article 99 in conjunction with Rule 
55(c) EPC, the notice of opposition must, inter alia, 
contain a statement of the extent to which the European 
patent is opposed and of the grounds on which the op-
position is based as well as an indication of the facts, 
evidence and arguments presented in support of these 
grounds. The importance of this requirement is under-
lined by the fact that the non-observance of it within 
the period of nine months prescribed by Article 99(1) 
EPC renders the opposition inadmissible according to 
Rule 56(1) EPC, with the result that the EPO loses 
competence to deal with the patent altogether.  
5. The core of the matter in the present cases before the 
Enlarged Board is, therefore, whether or not - or to 
what extent - an Opposition Division or a Board of Ap-
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peal in its examination of an opposition or an appeal is 
bound by the statement of the opponent under Rule 
55(c) EPC of the extent to which the patent is opposed 
and of the grounds for opposition. In other words: does 
that statement limit the power and the obligation of the 
EPO in its examination of the case or may or even 
should such examination go beyond the opposition as 
filed and be extended to other parts of the patent and to 
other grounds for opposition than those covered by 
such statement? A further question to be considered in 
this context is whether or not the same principles are to 
be applied to proceedings before an Opposition Divi-
sion and to appeal proceedings, having regard to the 
different legal character of such proceedings.  
6. According to Article 101(2) EPC, the examination of 
the opposition shall be conducted in accordance with 
the provisions of the Implementing Regulations (i.e. the 
Rules). Read in conjunction only with Rule 56(1) EPC, 
Rule 55(c) EPC may give the impression that the con-
tent of the statement of Rule 55(c) EPC only implies a 
formal requirement for admissibility of the opposition 
without any further legal effect on the examination of 
the opposition. This would seem to be the position of 
the opponent (appellant) in case G 9/91. In the 
Enlarged Board's opinion, this is a too narrow view on 
the function of Rule 55(c) EPC. This provision must be 
considered in the context of the EPC as a whole, having 
regard to the particular character of its post-grant oppo-
sition system as outlined above. Being so considered, 
Rule 55(c) EPC only makes sense interpreted as having 
the double function of governing (together with other 
provisions) the admissibility of the opposition and of 
establishing at the same time the legal and factual 
framework, within which the substantive examination 
of the opposition in principle shall be conducted. The 
latter function is of particular importance in that it 
gives the patentee a fair chance to consider his position 
at an early stage of the proceedings.  
7. This having been said, the question arises whether 
the above principal framework for the substantive ex-
amination of the opposition is subject to any 
exceptions. In the Board's view, a distinction has here 
to be made between the two main requirements of the 
statement under Rule 55(c) EPC, i.e. the indication of 
the extent to which the European patent is opposed and 
the grounds for opposition, respectively.  
8. As to the former requirement, which is the subject of 
the referral in case G 9/91, it has to be noted that in 
practice it is rather unusual that the opposition is lim-
ited to only a certain part (subject-matter) of the patent. 
Normally, the whole of the patent is opposed. Some-
times this is not explicitly explained in the notice of 
opposition but it appears by implication that the opposi-
tion is directed to the whole of the patent. There may be 
cases when the notice of opposition has to be inter-
preted in this respect, in particular when only certain 
claims are explicitly dealt with in the notice (cf. the de-
cision of 20 July 1989 in case T 192/88). However, the 
Enlarged Board sees no reason in the present context to 
go further into this problem, but will confine its consid-
erations mainly to the situation where it is clear from 

the statement under Rule 55(c) EPC that the patent is 
opposed only to a certain extent, as illustrated e.g. by 
the case before the referring Board of Appeal 3.3.3 (see 
paragraph I above; cf. also paragraph 11 below).  
9. It has also to be noted that the jurisprudence of the 
Boards of Appeal on this issue so far is very limited. In 
fact, there would seem to be only one decision analys-
ing in some depth the legal implication of the statement 
under Rule 55(c) EPC containing a limitation of the ex-
tent to which the European patent is opposed, namely 
the decision in case T 9/87 referred to in paragraph IV 
above. In this decision it was held that the examination 
of an opposition under Article 101 EPC is limited by 
the statement in the notice of opposition of the extent to 
which the patent is opposed. Article 114(1) EPC should 
be interpreted as subject to Article 101 EPC in this re-
spect. It was further stated in the decision that neither 
the Opposition Division nor a Board of Appeal has the 
obligation or the power to examine and decide on the 
maintenance of a European patent except to the extent 
to which it is opposed. It appears from the decision that 
it is mainly based on the consideration that opposition 
proceedings constitute an exception to the general rule 
under the EPC that a European patent after grant is no 
longer within the competence of the EPO but becomes 
a bundle of patents within the jurisdiction of the desig-
nated Contracting States. In his submissions before the 
Enlarged Board, the opponent (appellant) in case G 
9/91 has challenged this decision, in particular for not 
taking duly into account the overriding importance of 
Article 114 EPC.  
10. The conclusion of the Enlarged Board on this mat-
ter comes close to that of the above decision in case T 
9/87. The requirement of Rule 55(c) EPC to specify the 
extent to which the patent is opposed within the time 
limit prescribed by Article 99(1) EPC would obviously 
be pointless if later on other parts of the patent than 
those so opposed could freely be drawn into the pro-
ceedings. This would also be contrary to the basic 
concept of post-grant opposition under the EPC as out-
lined above. By limiting the extent to which the patent 
is opposed to only certain subject-matters, the opponent 
deliberately refrains from making use of his right under 
the EPC to oppose remaining subject-matters covered 
by the patent. Such subject-matters are therefore, 
strictly speaking, not subject to any "opposition" in the 
sense of Articles 101 and 102 EPC, nor are there any 
"proceedings" in the sense of Articles 114 and 115 EPC 
in existence concerning such non-opposed subject-
matters. Consequently, the EPO has no competence to 
deal with them at all.  
11. It follows that the answer to the first question put to 
the Enlarged Board in case G 9/91 has to be affirma-
tive. However, even if the opposition is explicitly 
directed only to the subject-matter of an independent 
claim of a European patent, subject-matters covered by 
claims which depend on such an independent claim 
may also be examined as to patentability, if the inde-
pendent claim falls in opposition or appeal proceedings, 
provided their validity is prima facie in doubt on the 
basis of already available information (cf. T 293/88, OJ 

www.ip-portal.eu  Page 4 of 6 



 
www.ippt.eu  IPPT19930331, EBA-EPO, Power to examine – Rohm and Haas 

EPO 1992, 220). Such dependent subject-matters have 
to be considered as being implicitly covered by the 
statement under Rule 55(c) EPC (cf. paragraph 8 
above).  
12. Turning to the second main requirement of the 
statement under Rule 55(c) EPC, i.e. the indication of 
the grounds on which the opposition is based, which is 
the subject of the referral in case G 10/91, the problems 
involved differ from those related to the first main re-
quirement as dealt with above in the following sense: 
While in the case of the extent to which the patent is 
opposed, it is a matter of the formal competence of an 
Opposition Division or a Board of Appeal to deal with 
a timely non-opposed part of a European patent, the 
problems connected with the grounds for opposition 
rather concern the procedural principles to be applied in 
opposition proceedings where the European patent (or a 
part of it) has been correctly opposed in accordance 
with Rule 55(c) EPC on at least one of the grounds 
listed in Article 100 EPC. The patent (or the relevant 
part of it) is, so to speak, already under fire in the latter 
case.  
13. As submitted by the President of the EPO, very 
conflicting views have been taken on this point of law 
in the jurisprudence of the Boards of Appeal. In par-
ticular, the decisions in cases T 493/88 and T 182/89 
represent quite irreconcilable approaches. In case T 
493/88 it was held that Articles 101(1) and 102(2) EPC 
clearly refer to all the grounds for opposition set out in 
Article 100(a) to (c) EPC and do not limit the scope of 
the examination to be carried out by the Opposition Di-
vision merely to the grounds for opposition mentioned 
by the opponent in the notice of opposition pursuant to 
Rule 55(c) EPC; an opposite view on this would also be 
in conflict with the principle of examination by the 
EPO of its own motion as laid down in Article 114(1) 
EPC. In other words: the Opposition Division has not 
only the right but even the duty to examine all grounds 
for opposition set out in Article 100 EPC, irrespective 
of whether the opponent in the statement pursuant to 
Rule 55(c) EPC has based the opposition only on one 
or two of these three grounds. In contrast to this, in 
case T 182/89 it was held that in principle Article 
114(1) EPC should not be interpreted as requiring the 
Opposition Division or a Board of Appeal to investi-
gate whether support exists for grounds for opposition 
which have not been properly supported by the oppo-
nent, but should be interpreted as enabling the EPO to 
investigate fully the grounds for opposition which have 
been both alleged and properly supported as required 
by Rule 55(c) EPC. In his submissions before the 
Enlarged Board, the opponent (appellant) in case G 
9/91 strongly supported the approach taken in case T 
493/88; the other approach would entail the risk of the 
maintenance of invalid European patents, thereby ren-
dering the EPC less attractive.  
14. Obviously, the approach taken in case T 493/88 is 
not compatible with the principle established by the 
Enlarged Board in paragraph 6 above, based on the 
concept of post-grant opposition under the EPC. Fur-
thermore, the fact that in Articles 101(1) and 102(2) 

EPC references are made to "the grounds" for opposi-
tion laid down in Article 100 EPC, i.e. all such 
grounds, cannot be considered as implying that all such 
grounds always have to be examined irrespective of the 
opponent's submissions. A corresponding purely literal 
interpretation of Article 102(1) EPC would e.g. make it 
impossible to revoke a patent, if not all the grounds for 
opposition mentioned in Article 100 EPC prejudiced 
the maintenance of the patent, which would be clearly 
absurd. The plural form "grounds" has to be considered 
only as a legal and technical means of covering the to-
tal possible framework of the examination. It also goes 
without saying that the approach taken in case T 493/88 
is contrary to the general interest of procedural expedi-
ency.  
15. The approach taken in case T 182/89 is clearly 
more in line with the concept of post-grant opposition 
under the EPC as outlined above. The Enlarged Board 
agrees that Article 114(1) EPC is no legal basis for an 
obligatory review of grounds for opposition not cov-
ered by the statement pursuant to Rule 55(c) EPC. The 
crucial point is, however, whether Article 114(1) EPC 
empowers the Opposition Division or a Board of Ap-
peal to investigate such grounds at all.  
16. Although the wording of Article 114 EPC does not 
formally cover the concept of grounds for opposition, 
there would seem to be support in the travaux prépara-
toires to the EPC for the opinion that the principle of 
examination by the EPO of its own motion as laid 
down in Article 114 EPC was intended to be applied 
even to that concept at least in proceedings before the 
Opposition Division (cf. BR/87/71, point 9). This has 
also been accepted in the practice of the EPO (cf. 
Guidelines for substantive examination of opposition, 
Part D, Chapter V). The Enlarged Board does not con-
sider that there is sufficient justification for changing 
this practice insofar as it concerns the proceedings be-
fore the Opposition Division. It is obviously aimed at 
avoiding the maintenance of European patents which 
are invalid. Thus, an Opposition Division may, in ap-
plication of Article 114(1) EPC, of its own motion raise 
a ground for opposition not covered by the statement 
pursuant to Rule 55(c) EPC or consider such a ground 
raised by the opponent (or referred to by a third party 
under Article 115 EPC) after the expiry of the time 
limit laid down in Article 99(1) EPC. At the same time, 
the Enlarged Board would like to emphasise that the 
consideration of grounds not properly covered by the 
statement pursuant to Rule 55(c) EPC, as an exception 
to the principle established by the Board in paragraph 6 
above, should only take place before the Opposition 
Division in cases where, prima facie, there are clear 
reasons to believe that such grounds are relevant and 
would in whole or in part prejudice the maintenance of 
the European patent. The possibility of disregarding 
facts and evidence in support of fresh grounds not 
submitted in due time under Article 114(2) EPC should 
of course also be kept in mind.  
17. Although the question put to the Enlarged Board in 
case G 10/91 is formally restricted to the proceedings 
before the Opposition Division, it is appropriate in this 
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context to clarify the situation also in respect of the ap-
peal procedure (cf. Rule 66(1) EPC).  
18. The purpose of the appeal procedure inter partes is 
mainly to give the losing party the possibility of chal-
lenging the decision of the Opposition Division on its 
merits. It is not in conformity with this purpose to con-
sider grounds for opposition on which the decision of 
the Opposition Division has not been based. Further-
more, in contrast to the merely administrative character 
of the opposition procedure, the appeal procedure is to 
be considered as a judicial procedure, as explained by 
the Enlarged Board in its recently issued decisions in 
cases G 7/91 and G 8/91 (see point 7 of the reasons). 
Such procedure is by its very nature less investigative 
than an administrative procedure. Although Article 
114(1) EPC formally covers also the appeal procedure, 
it is therefore justified to apply this provision generally 
in a more restrictive manner in such procedure than in 
opposition procedure. In particular with regard to fresh 
grounds for opposition, for the above reasons the 
Enlarged Board considers that such grounds may in 
principle not be introduced at the appeal stage. This ap-
proach also reduces the procedural uncertainty for 
patentees having otherwise to face unforeseeable com-
plications at a very late stage of the proceedings, 
putting at risk the revocation of the patent, which 
means an irrevocable loss of rights. Opponents are in 
this respect in a better position, having always the pos-
sibility of initiating revocation proceedings before 
national courts, if they do not succeed before the EPO. 
However, an exception to the above principle is justi-
fied in case the patentee agrees that a fresh ground for 
opposition may be considered: volenti non fit injuria. It 
may in some cases be in his own interest that such a 
ground is not excluded from consideration in the cen-
tralised procedure before the EPO. However, it goes 
without saying that such a ground should only be raised 
by a Board of Appeal or, if raised by an opponent, be 
admitted into the proceedings, if it is considered by the 
Board to be already prima facie highly relevant. If a 
fresh ground is admitted, the case should, having regard 
to the purpose of the appeal procedure as stated above, 
be remitted to the first instance for further prosecution, 
unless special reasons present themselves for doing 
otherwise. It may be added that if the patentee does not 
agree to the introduction of a fresh ground for opposi-
tion, such a ground may not be dealt with in substance 
in the decision of the Board of Appeal at all. Only the 
fact that the question has been raised may be men-
tioned. 19. In order to avoid any misunderstanding, it 
should finally be confirmed that in case of amendments 
of the claims or other parts of a patent in the course of 
opposition or appeal proceedings, such amendments are 
to be fully examined as to their compatibility with the 
requirements of the EPC (e.g. with regard to the provi-
sions of Article 123(2) and (3) EPC).  
ORDER        
For these reasons it is decided that:  
The questions of law referred to the Enlarged Board are 
to be answered as follows:  

The power of an Opposition Division or a Board of 
Appeal to examine and decide on the maintenance of a 
European patent under Articles 101 and 102 EPC de-
pends upon the extent to which the patent is opposed in 
the notice of opposition pursuant to Rule 55(c) EPC. 
However, subject-matters of claims depending on an 
independent claim, which falls in opposition or appeal 
proceedings, may be examined as to their patentability 
even if they have not been explicitly opposed, provided 
their validity is prima facie in doubt on the basis of al-
ready available information. 
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